

**BID TABULATION SHEET  
FREDERICK COUNTY, VA PUBLIC SCHOOLS  
ICE CREAM PRODUCTS  
IFB 21018  
BID DATE AND TIME: August 20, 2021 @ 1:00 P.M.**

Vendors	Garber Ice Cream	Hershey Ice Cream
Certification of Contractor	X	X
SCC Registration Requirements	X	X

**Pricing Sheets Attached**

**IFB 21018; Ice Cream Products Bid Tabulation**  
**Vendor: Garber Ice Cream**

<b>ITEM</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>UNIT COST</b>	<b>PER ITEM COST</b>
1	Reduced Fat Cookie & Cream Cone 4oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>8.90</b>	<b>0.370833333</b>
2	Reduced Fat 4oz Vanilla Sandwich Brand <b><u>Garber</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>5.97</b>	<b>0.24875</b>
3	Reduced Fat Chocolate Eclair Brand <b><u>Rich's</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>8.60</b>	<b>0.358333333</b>
4	Reduced Fat Strawberry Eclair Brand <b><u>Rich's</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>8.60</b>	<b>0.358333333</b>
5	Rich Fudge Frenzy Bar Brand <b><u>Rich's</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.75</b>	<b>0.28125</b>
6	Rich Ice Cream Bar Brand <b><u>Rich's</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>7.60</b>	<b>0.316666667</b>
7	Rich Orange Cream Bar Brand <b><u>Rich's</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.75</b>	<b>0.28125</b>
8	Cotton Candy Push-up 3oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>7.48</b>	<b>0.311666667</b>
9	Vanilla Fudge Push-up 3oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>7.48</b>	<b>0.311666667</b>
10	Reduced Fat Cotton Candy Cup 3oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.08</b>	<b>0.253333333</b>
11	Orange Juice Up 3oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>5.95</b>	<b>0.247916667</b>
12	Reduced Fat Strawberry Ripple Cup 3 oz. Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.08</b>	<b>0.253333333</b>
13	Reduced Fat Vanilla Fudge Cup 3oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.08</b>	<b>0.253333333</b>
14	Reduced Fat Vanilla Chocolate Cup 3oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.08</b>	<b>0.253333333</b>
15	Raspberry Sherbert 4oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.29</b>	<b>0.262083333</b>
16	Orange Sherbet 4oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.29</b>	<b>0.262083333</b>
17	Strawberry Yogurt 4oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>Not Available</b>	<b>0</b>
18	Vanilla or Chocolate Yogurt 4oz Brand <b><u>Frederick Farms</u></b> Pack <b><u>24 pk</u></b>	24/box	<b>6.29</b>	<b>0.262083333</b>
	<b>Total Category Ice Cream</b>		<b>117.27</b>	<b>4.88625</b>

**IFB 21018; Ice Cream Products Bid Tabulation**  
**Vendor: Hershey Ice Cream**

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT COST	PER ITEM COST
1	Reduced Fat Cookie & Cream Cone 4oz Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>24 pk</b>	24/box	<b>12.85</b>	<b>0.535416667</b>
2	Reduced Fat 4oz Vanilla Sandwich Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>24 pk</b>	24/box	<b>11.59</b>	<b>0.482916667</b>
3	Reduced Fat Chocolate Eclair Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>36 pk</b>	36/box	<b>12.10</b>	<b>0.336111111</b>
4	Reduced Fat Strawberry Eclair Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>36 pk</b>	36/box	<b>12.10</b>	<b>0.336111111</b>
5	Rich Fudge Frenzy Bar Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>36 pk</b>	36/box	<b>10.58</b>	<b>0.293888889</b>
6	Rich Ice Cream Bar Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>36 pk</b>	36/box	<b>10.58</b>	<b>0.293888889</b>
7	Rich Orange Cream Bar Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>36 pk</b>	36/box	<b>10.58</b>	<b>0.293888889</b>
8	Cotton Candy Push-up 3oz Brand <b>Hershey (Twister Cup)</b> Pack <b>18 pk</b>	18/box	<b>9.45</b>	<b>0.525</b>
9	Vanilla Fudge Push-up 3oz Brand _____ Pack _____	24/box	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>0</b>
10	Reduced Fat Cotton Candy Cup 3oz Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>48 pk</b>	48/box	<b>14.62</b>	<b>0.304583333</b>
11	Orange Juice Up 3oz Brand _____ Pack _____	24/box	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>0</b>
12	Reduced Fat Strawberry Ripple Cup 3 oz. Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>48 pk</b>	48/box	<b>14.62</b>	<b>0.304583333</b>
13	Reduced Fat Vanilla Fudge Cup 3oz Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>48 pk</b>	48/box	<b>14.62</b>	<b>0.304583333</b>
14	Reduced Fat Vanilla Chocolate Cup 3oz Brand <b>Hershey</b> Pack <b>48 pk</b>	48/box	<b>14.62</b>	<b>0.304583333</b>
15	Raspberry Sherbert 4oz Brand _____ Pack _____	24/box	<b>7.68</b>	<b>0.32</b>
16	Orange Sherbet 4oz Brand _____ Pack _____	24/box	<b>7.68</b>	<b>0.32</b>
17	Strawberry Yogurt 4oz Brand _____ Pack _____	24/box	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>0</b>
18	Vanilla or Chocolate Yogurt 4oz Brand _____ Pack _____	24/box	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>0</b>
	<b>Total Category Ice Cream</b>		<b>163.67</b>	<b>4.955555556</b>